
CITY OF CAMDEN 
BUREAU OF PURCHASING 

CITY HALL – ROOM 213 

P.O. BOX 95120 

CAMDEN, NEW JERSEY   08101-5120 

856-757-7159 

856-541-9668 (FAX) 

 

 

BID RESULTS 

 

BID # 20-13        

 

 
BID NAME:  BODY DAMAGE REPAIRS TO AUTOMOBILE, SUV, LIGHT/MEDIUM/HEAVY 

DUTY TRUCKS FOR A PERIOD OF ONE YEAR WITH A 2ND YEAR OPTION (INCLUDING 

PAINTING, FRAME REPAIRS AND MECHANICAL REPAIRS Only Related to BODY 

DAMAGES)  

 

 

 

BID DUE:       THURSDAY, AUGUST 20, 2020 @ 11:00AM 

 

- 

VENDOR AMOUNT 

MALL CHEVROLET 

CHERRY HILL,NJ 

1. Automobiles /SUV’s  

 1500 hours (more or less)   

 (To include Body, Paint and Clear coat labor pricing)  

 1500 x $34.69 hourly rate = $ 52,035.00 Total  

 

1A. Light/Medium and Heavy Duty Trucks 

     1500 Hours (More or less)  

 (To include Body, Paint and Clear coat labor pricing)  

 1500 x $35.00 hourly rate  = $52,500.00 Total  

 

1B. Paint Supplies for City Vehicles 

 500 hours (more or less) 500  x $29.99 hourly rate  =  

$14,995.00 Total  

 

1C. Mechanical 

 (Only as a result of Body Damages)  

 500 hours (more or less) 500 x $39.00 hourly rate  = 

$19,500.00 Total  

 

Grand Total  $  139,030.00 

                      Total Amount of 1+1A+1B+1C 



H.A DEHART & SON 

THOROFARE, NJ 

1.               Automobiles /SUV’s  

 1500 hours (more or less)   

 (To include Body, Paint and Clear coat labor pricing)  

 1500 x NO BID hourly rate = NO BID Total  

 

1A. Light/Medium and Heavy Duty Trucks 

     1500 Hours (More or less)  

 (To include Body, Paint and Clear coat labor pricing)  

 1500 x NO BID hourly rate  = NO BID Total  

 

1B. Paint Supplies for City Vehicles 

 500 hours (more or less) 500 NO BID  x hourly rate  =  

NO BID Total  

 

1C. Mechanical 

 (Only as a result of Body Damages)  

 500 hours (more or less) 500 x $90.00 hourly rate  = 

45,000.00 Total  

 

Grand Total  $  45,000.00 

                      Total Amount of 1+1A+1B+1C 

BELLMAWR TRUCK REPAIR CO. 

BELLMAWR, NJ 

1.              Automobiles /SUV’s  

 1500 hours (more or less)   

 (To include Body, Paint and Clear coat labor pricing)  

 1500 x $85.00 hourly rate = $127,500.00 Total  

 

1A. Light/Medium and Heavy Duty Trucks 

     1500 Hours (More or less)  

 (To include Body, Paint and Clear coat labor pricing)  

 1500 x $85.00 hourly rate  = $127,500.00 Total  

 

1B. Paint Supplies for City Vehicles 

 500 hours (more or less) 500 50.00  x hourly rate  =  

$25,000.00 Total  

 

1C. Mechanical 

 (Only as a result of Body Damages)  

 500 hours (more or less) 500 x $85.00 hourly rate  = 

$42,500 Total  

 

Grand Total  $  322,500.00 

                      Total Amount of 1+1A+1B+1C 



BELLMAWR COLLISION CENTER 

RUNNEMEDE,NJ 

1 Automobiles /SUV’s  

 1500 hours (more or less)   

 (To include Body, Paint and Clear coat labor pricing)  

 1500 x $33.00 hourly rate = $49,500.00 Total  

 

1A. Light/Medium and Heavy Duty Trucks 

     1500 Hours (More or less)  

 (To include Body, Paint and Clear coat labor pricing)  

 1500 x $35.00 hourly rate  = $52,500.00 Total  

 

1B. Paint Supplies for City Vehicles 

 500 hours (more or less) 500  x $26.00 hourly rate  =  

$13,000.00 Total  

 

1C. Mechanical 

 (Only as a result of Body Damages)  

 500 hours (more or less) 500 x $33.00 hourly rate  = 

$16,500.00 Total  

 

Grand Total  $  131,500.00 

                      Total Amount of 1+1A+1B+1C 

 

 

Bid results are for information purposes only. 

rp 


